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Abstract. Through the decades’ Armenian agriculture doesn’t have sufficient growth. Technologies and methodology used by 
farmers are not sufficient for modern production creation. Financing system of rural areas are less effective as lack of stable 
income and low-price collateral doesn’t let banking institutions to actively finance the sector. The main purpose of this study is 
to define problems of agricultural financing and determine leasing as an effective tool for agricultural financing. Methodology 
of this study is based on quantitative analysis among farmers and other borrowers to take out leasing role in financing process 
and other relevant issues. Empirical data analysis of different countries’ experience and survey among local rural habitants 
were made to identify the most effective tools of agricultural financing. As a result, lack of effective financial and technological 
assistance has identified as an obstacle of agricultural development in Armenia. The importance of agriculture in the develop-
ment of the country's economy was substantiated. The importance of public awareness in increasing the applicability of leasing 
has been identified. As a scientific novelty, the thesis of leasing as an effective financial tool for agricultural lending has been 
proven. The specifics of leasing efficiency for agricultural lending are explained. Absence of collateral as the only advantage 
of leasing was rejected.
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Introduction
Armenia is an industrial-agrarian country. The country is a 

predominantly rural and about 50 % of its population engaged 
in agriculture which demonstrates also social importance of 
agricultural development. Crop production and cattle breeding 
is the main source of income for most of its rural population. 
At present, the vast majority of gross agricultural output (more 
than 98 %) is provided by the private sector. The economy of 
Armenia gives priority to small-scale agricultural production. 
In the structure of GDP, it accounts for: agriculture – 31.1 %, 
industry – 21.8 %, trade – 8.7 %, construction – 8.5 %, trans-
port – 5.1 %, other sectors – 24.9 %. The main crops grown 
are melons and gourds, potatoes, wheat, grapes, fruit, essential 
oil, tobacco, and sugar beets. Livestock farming specializes in 
dairy and beef cattle breeding, sheep are raised in mountain-
ous areas. Armenia is an important center of agro biodiversity. 
The rich agro biodiversity of Armenia is represented by wild 
relatives of grain crops, wild edible plants and a large number 
of plant varieties and animal breeds. Currently, a large number 
of plant species are grown in Armenia, including 6 types of 
crops, 366 fodder plants, 62 types of berries and 65 types of 
vegetables. In total, 521 plant species account for 16 % of the 
total number of plants in Armenia. This reserve was created to 
protect the genetic diversity of wild, related forms of crops. 
In 2018 the value added in agriculture accounted for 13.7 per-
cent of GDP; the gross agricultural output amounted to 1.8 
billion USD, 46 % of which (828 million USD) was generated 

from crop production, 54 % (972 million USD) from livestock 
products. Russia is the major export market for beverages 
and crop and livestock commodities, with more than 70 % of 
exports by value. This high dependence on Russian markets 
makes the agriculture sector highly vulnerable to the volatility 
of the Russian economy. The European Union (EU) receives 
less than 5 % of the value of exports for these two commodity 
groups [1, p. 2].

According to Armenian Prime Minister speech dated on 
23.03.2020, especially in the context of the crisis associated 
with the coronavirus, agriculture is becoming one of the most 
important areas of activity. Although this area has always been 
interesting, under the new conditions, the importance of agri-
culture is emphasized for several reasons. Firstly, food secu-
rity issues are becoming increasingly relevant and important 
not only in the Republic of Armenia, but throughout the world. 
Secondly, agriculture is a sector where there are more prefera-
ble and effective opportunities for maintaining social distance. 
Thirdly, in Armenia there are wide opportunities for creating 
new jobs in agriculture and for ensuring self-employment. And 
fourthly, we believe that now is a very convenient time for 
carrying out such institutional reforms that were previously 
impossible for objective or subjective reasons. 

Empirical data shows, that during pandemics, the agricul-
ture sector remains the most important economic sector, for 
the poor in many developing countries. Closed borders and 
limited international commerce accelerate local agricultural 
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and rural growth. In contrast, many researchers and interna-
tional organizations like UNDP, FAO have analyzed different 
illnesses and pandemics impact of agricultural sustainability 
and growth. Different impact elements were taking out on ag-
ricultural production such as reduction in area of land under 
cultivation, declining yields and livestock, loss in agricultural 
skills [2, p. 9]. We see, that decline in food production and 
farmers’ production is expected during pandemics which will 
impact also on food security. At the same time, food consump-
tion is also reducing in all surviving families. The facts show 
that it is important during pandemics to gather more families 
and entrepreneurs in agriculture with Government supporting 
programs and effective financial instruments to secure food 
deficit and increase farm production. One of the key issues of 
agricultural development remains access to effective financial 
resources. 

Lack of access to financial resources is a key obstacle for 
poor countries to develop. In the second quarter of 2020, Ar-
menia had 17 commercial banks and 42 microcredit organiza-
tions, 4 of which are registered as specialized leasing organiza-
tions, but one of them in fact is not functioning. Only one bank 
out of 17 is specialized in the financing of rural communities 
(ACBA Credit Agricole Bank), as well as several credit orga-
nizations were also actively involved in it. Commercial banks, 
in general, were not interested to provide financial services in 
rural areas because of different reasons. Farms and small food 
processing companies have lack of sufficient collateral to ob-
tain a loan for their future growth and projects. In emerging 
countries rural habitants and entrepreneurs can’t find any other 
affordable financing which can be substitute to classic bank fi-
nancing. In this situation, it becomes very important to create a 
financial instrument which will partly or fully cover collateral 
problem. Leasing is a financing tool that overcomes this idea.

Leasing as a modern financial instrument is used in early 
50s in USA. After that, year by year it becomes more popular 
and starts to serve as an alternative for car loans and equipment 
and technology acquisition targeted business loans. Leasing is 
a financial instrument which can cover collateral issues for 
many of those rural area borrowers as the lease object itself be-
comes as a collateral. If the lease object is general equipment 
or technology, it becomes easier to sign the contract as leas-
ing object becomes more liquid item and easier to sell or pro-
vide secondary leasing in case of lease contract failure. From 
economic perspective leasing is a contract between lessor and 
lessee where lessor provides lease equipment to lessee (in clas-
sic leasing contract lessee chooses lease object) for a certain 
period of time and gets lease payments from lessee [3, pp. 7]. 
From accounting standards leasing contract is an agreement 
where lessor provides lease object to borrower for a certain 
period of time for using and gets regular payments in regular 
dates as a compensation. In general, there are financial and op-
erational leasing types. A finance leasing agreement as a rule 
is long term and borrower buys lease equipment in the end of 
the contract. In other words, during finance lease the borrower 
leases equipment with the purpose to own it after the contract. 
In contrast, operational lease is a short-term contract and in 
general the lease object in the end of the lease agreement stays 
for lessor’s ownership. In this case borrower doesn’t think 
about to buy the lease object in the end of the contract. As 

per Breadley, et al., there are three types of leasing: direct, 
when the manufacturer and lessor becomes the same side of 
the contract, operational, when the maintenance and other gen-
eral expenses of lease object falls on lessor and the sides of the 
contract can cancel leasing agreement before the expiry of the 
contract, and the third and last one is financial leasing, which 
is the most common one when the lessee implies all the costs 
of lease object itself and in the end gets all the rights of it [4, 
pp. 548–551].

In Armenia, first leasing contracts started in early 2000s 
with creation of Agroleasing company. In 2003, the company 
registered in central bank of Armenia as a leasing credit com-
pany as the legislation changes and lease provision becomes a 
licensed activity. It is not a coincidence that first lease agree-
ments in Armenia started in agricultural sphere as that was the 
most demanded sector of the economy for a modern financial 
instrument as the classic ones doesn’t work anymore. Till 
nowadays, leasing plays a vital role in agricultural financing 
in Armenia as it becomes also an instrument which Govern-
ment uses for implementing state support programs. It is a fact 
that leasing has been successfully implemented as a financial 
instrument which helps financing farmers and rural habitants 
with better conditions rather than classic financial instruments. 
Having awareness about benefits of leasing and information 
about specificities of this product farmers better use advan-
tages of leasing compared with traditional banking loans and 
also gets more competitive interest rates [5, pp. 47–60].

Having several advantages like additional non-financial 
services from leasing companies and irrefutable purpose of 
financing makes leasing an important financial instrument for 
different sectors of economy and especially for rural area bor-
rowers which end to different obstacles during when applying 
for a regular loan. For farmers, sometimes leasing becomes 
the only way to get financing as in their conditions they cannot 
access to bank loans. In addition, down payment and first in-
vestment of the project is also lower for leasing as the required 
lease object is easier controllable rather than cash money. In 
many countries’ creditor rights are weak and they need to pass 
a long court procedure to take possession of collateral and 
in terms of leasing the lessor is the owner of the lease object 
without going to court. In contrast, in Armenia and in many 
CIS countries it takes the same length of time to prove the right 
to get the lease object back which doesn’t let to use benefits of 
leasing. Thus, taking into consideration of all the arguments 
mentioned, it is important to mention that there is no clearly 
applicable methodology for evaluating the effectiveness of 
leasing for different parts of the contract and no techniques fo-
cused on financial benefits and effects for the lessee who have 
been taken leasing product [6, pp. 1104–1106]. At the same 
time, Governments of emerging countries which accept ben-
efits of leasing needs to change their regulatory more familiar 
for lease contracts and specially to adopt judiciary system for 
making easier taking back lease object from borrowers who 
doesn’t payback lease payments on time.

One of the specificities of the agriculture growth in the 
Post-Soviet countries is the necessity to invest into production 
development, mainly in buying modern machinery and equip-
ment and provision of it with acceptable financial terms and 
conditions. All this leads to the necessity to seek alternative 
ways of financing investments, mainly leasing. 
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The objective of this paper is to analyze potential of leasing 
as an effective tool for rural area development financial tool, 
as an alternative for classic agricultural loans and microloans. 
The paper defines reasons why banks doesn’t actively finance 
rural entrepreneurs and farmers and its advantages. Apart from 
this, the work provides overview of leasing utility in the rural 
area financing sector within its framework. The paper con-
cludes by providing recommendations for enhancing Govern-
ment support to expand access to leasing in rural areas. Three 
general objectives of this study are to:

• identify reasons of why banks don’t want to finance ag-
riculture;

• evaluate benefits of leasing for government support of 
agriculture;

• evaluate advantages of lease financing for rural habitants.
The economic incentives for leasing as being an effective 

tool for machinery, equipment and other objects for farmers 
and other rural area habitants are primarily lack of information 
about leasing product in general. The advantages of leasing 
such as absence of collateral, tax related, additional benefits 
from manufacturers in case of leasing projects are important 
on decision making process of clients. But results of survey 
shown that only classic advantages are not fair enough to stop 
on choosing leasing. Other benefits such as discounts from 
manufacturers can play important role in leasing promotion. 
The current issues of rural habitants to access financial re-
sources are equivalent important in the leasing decision. These 
factors, and associated incentives are identified in this study 
through a survey of selected issues among rural habitants in 
Armenia.

Methods
Different theoretical and empirical methodologies are used 

to meet the specific objectives in this article the paper analyses 
the impact of leasing as a financial tool for rural area financ-
ing and development. At the same time, multiple Government 
support projects were analyzed to understand whether leasing 
plays role in Government projects for financial support of bor-
rowers. For this purpose, mainly to meet first two objectives 
of the article, a questionnaire is prepared and randomly sent to 
rural habitants and farmers. For analyzing facts about leasing 
development and its usage in RA, input results of quantita-
tive analysis to SPSS were made to get statistical information 
within the answers of the questions. Some statistical data used 
in this paper were obtained from the Armstat and official web-
sites of Armenian banks and MFIs, foreign governmental and 
other official websites. To meet the third objective, alternative 
financial tools and mechanisms were discussed on this paper to 
find out substitutes of leasing in financial market which have 
been used in different countries. For this purpose, analysis of 
articles was done to discover any long-run benefits of leasing 
for rural development.

Results
Nowadays, agriculture is much more than farming; it is 

becoming more and more integrated with other sectors of the 
economy, and this integration requires optimization through 
the use of digital technologies. E-agriculture is the use of in-
formation and communication technologies in agriculture, 
including crop production, livestock, fisheries and forestry. It 
implies the use of both traditional technologies, such as radio, 

television and mobile phones, as well as the latest digital tech-
nologies, such as unmanned aerial vehicles, satellites, sensor 
technologies, the Internet of things and machine communi-
cations. The country's agricultural sector can take advantage 
of the use of digital technologies, provided that a strategy is 
clearly defined at the national level, the development of which 
will involve stakeholders from the public and private sectors, 
smallholders and family farmers, non-governmental organiza-
tions and the scientific community, as well as country’s rural 
development goals taken into account [7, p. 18]. According to 
FAO data, the goal of e-agriculture is to develop agriculture 
and rural areas through the application of improved informa-
tion and communication processes. This includes the creation 
of concepts, design, development, evaluation and application 
of innovative methods of using information and communica-
tion technologies in the agricultural sector, covering the entire 
food system [8].

Leasing is at a poor stage of development in Armenia. 
Comparing with developed countries, leasing transactions in 
overall economic transactions are 10 times less of the aver-
age, and 5 times less in comparison with developing countries. 
However, the pace of development is growing year by year. 
As the experience of international countries shows, the devel-
opment of leasing begins with the classic rent. The next step 
is to get a loan to buy equipment [9, p. 38]. Leasing in the 
RA was first defined by the Civil Code of the Republic of Ar-
menia, which entered into force in 1999. Civil code defines, 
that the lessee undertakes to obtain the mentioned property 
of the lessee from the seller determined by the lessee and to 
transfer it to the temporary use of the lessee for a fixed fee 
[10, pp. 677–685]. Looking through the leasing in developing 
countries, we see that leasing is interesting to all parties of the 
contract: A producer of equipment that increases sales through 
leasing, a client who spends least possible financial resources 
gets the right to use the necessary equipment, and the govern-
ment can use leasing for state support projects and be sure for 
the right purpose of used funds. As in Armenia, the main areas 
of leasing are mining, leasing of construction equipment, leas-
ing of agricultural machinery and leasing of vehicles. Due to 
the juridical gap, only financial leasing is in effect in Armenia. 
The development of financial leases is also facilitated by state 
regulation of investment policies, in which the formation of 
tax and customs privileges for participants in financial leas-
es and the introduction of accelerated amortization of leased 
property play a crucial role. In general, this has a beneficial 
effect on the country's economy, contributing significantly to 
the regeneration of fixed assets in industry and agriculture [11, 
p. 32]. What concerns to latest legislative improvements on 
leasing in Armenia, on June 22, 2020, a package of legislative 
amendments on leasing was adopted, which excluded some of 
the obstacles associated with the taxation of the leased prop-
erty, property taxation issues were removed, as well as defini-
tion of secondary leasing, subleasing and other leasing details 
were fixed in tax code and civil code. This changes can signifi-
cantly increase the quantity of leasing contracts and affect on 
efficiency of financing of agriculture as main problems aris-
ing of agricultural financing covers leasing instrument (lack of 
collateral, inefficient monitoring of purpose of financing etc.).
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Different countries’ experience has been analyzed to un-
derstand specificities of agricultural growth and its financing 
obstacles. Experience of Russia, France, Serbia, India, USA, 
Ukraine, Kyrgyzstan and Armenia were discussed.

According to preliminary data from the Ministry of Ag-
riculture, in 2019, agricultural production in Russia grew by 
more than 2 % by 2018, when the industry experienced a 
decline of 0.2 %. In 2019, the export of Russian agricultural 
products amounted to about 25 billion USD, which is slight-
ly less than in 2018 (25.8 billion USD), but higher than the 
plan, which was set at 24 billion USD. In contrast, Minister 
of Agriculture of Russia D. N. Patrushev noted that in 2020 
an increase in livestock production is expected, including due 
to milk and meat [12]. A key attention is dedicated to leasing 
market which is a key indicator of the Russian economy. Leas-
ing is considered as an efficient means of business assistance 
and an effective tool of sustainable development, as well as 
a way of obtaining credit income and renovating main capi-
tal. At this phase of Russian economy development, it is vital 
to work out the relevant order of transactions and the Central 
Bank propose that the leasing business should draw amend-
ments to the existing regulations in order to create advanced 
control standards for leasing operations [13, p. 1].

As in France, it has a useful agricultural area of 27 million 
hectares, or 15 % of the UAA of the EU; moreover, it repre-
sents 18 % of the value of agricultural production in the Euro-
pean Union. By cultivating nearly 28 million hectares and con-
tributing 17 % to the value production of the European Union 
carried out in agriculture, France remains the main agricultural 
country in Europe. This increase in productivity is due to the 
genetic improvement of varieties, better crop protection and 
more efficient agronomic practices. In contrast, agricultural 
production in France contributes to the degradation of the en-
vironment. It affects air quality by generating 20 % of national 
greenhouse gas emissions, due to the use of fertilizers, heated 
greenhouses, strong mechanization, etc. [14, p. 16]. Many 
leasing companies in France are united in a national associa-
tion (ASF). Six lessors held 80.9 % of leasing operations in the 
country, while the first two lessors, SG Equipment Finance and 
BNP Paribas Lease Group, accounted for 47.7 %. The chal-
lenges France is struggling with in agriculture are the achieve-
ment of food and nutritional security and the development of 
sustainable agriculture for the period from 2019 to 2024.To do 
this, in particular, to promote such sustainable forms of agri-
culture as agro-ecology; access to quality food, drinking water 
and adequate sanitary and hygienic conditions [15, p. 7].

Rural segment has a significant role in Serbian economy. 
The portion of farming, forest industry and fishing in net worth 
included 2016 was 6.5 %. It employed 18.5 % of the total 
number of engaged persons in 2017 and has a share of 7 % 
in total export. Moreover, if we add data for manufacture of 
food products, beverages, tobacco, then the share of such pro-
duction in Serbian export is much more considerable, around 
22 %. As per Popovic, et al., agriculture in Serbia is character-
ized by insufficient profitability due to certain seasonal and 
extensive production cycle, weak specialization of production, 
low capacity utilization, low turnover ratio, higher exposure to 
natural hazards in latest years, and inefficient financing mecha-
nisms. Though there are diverse financial sources, their condi-

tions are badly designed and are not satisfying needs of agri-
cultural producers. Agro-crediting in Serbia is not even close 
to its full potential. Agricultural production is still influenced 
by the state support through subsidies from the agrarian sector, 
but still this doesn’t have sufficient role [16, pp. 66–70]. As 
per Popović, et al., only 5 banks finance agricultural sphere in 
Serbia because banks are not informed about the real potential 
of this segment of the economy and also risks which cover 
agricultural sphere are also not familiar to them. In agriculture 
business analysis is complicated and needs to use more knowl-
edge about food processing and other agricultural processes 
and technologies. Banks mention too many unresolved issues 
and uncertainty about the ability of agricultural producers and 
processors to meet their obligations and absence of high-qual-
ity collateral [17, p. 130].

O. Eremina found out, that agriculture is a dependence on 
climatic conditions, a long reproductive cycle, low profitabil-
ity of agricultural production, borrowing of commodity pro-
ducers, their insufficient state support (compared with the USA 
and EU countries), the price disparity of agriculture and its 
branches, a significant need for short-term and long-term bor-
rowed resources [18, p. 162]. For banks, it is clear that provid-
ing significant funding over long periods increases risk taking 
and requires specific skills to manage these risks at a reason-
able cost. As a result, financial institutions are often reluctant 
to provide such funding. In the past, to improve the supply 
governments have frequently intervened in term loans through 
rural development banks or various credit programs. However, 
following poor performance, both in terms of clientele and the 
viability of these directed loans, most of these credit programs 
were interrupted and several rural development banks filed for 
bankruptcy [8].

According to A. Das, & N. M. Patnaik, high cost of de-
livered services, lack of affiliate networks, perception of low 
profitability in agriculture, information skewness, high lev-
els of rural poverty or low levels of farmer education, lack 
of collateral and financial literacy are certain of the reasons 
why lenders are not interested to finance agriculture in India. 
The same problem exists in different regions in Asia. But most 
of banks’ managers are seen to blame high degree of uncon-
trolled production and price risk for not financing agriculture. 
Thus, farmers have to lean on non-institutional financial or-
ganizations. The significant sources of non-institutional credit 
are traders and commission agents, landlords, money lend-
ers, friends and relatives etc. Mainly all payments are made 
through cash. Lack of regular price information, commission 
agents and product quality are some of the issues connected 
with the input side while payments receivable by farmers are 
more often than not ridden with delays is the obstacles bound 
to output aspect [19, p. 6].

In contrast, the main driver for the recent activity of inter-
est in international investment in food production appears to 
be food security and a fear arising from the recent increase 
of food prices and possible supply shocks that may occur on 
global markets for foods supplies or agricultural raw materials 
has become riskier [20, p. 5]. This can be also up to date during 
COVID-19 pandemic as food security becomes modern issue 
in many countries in the beginning of pandemic.
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Despite its economic and political importance, the agricul-
tural sector of Armenia still faces a number of restrictions that 
limit its full potential. Agriculture growth slowed in response 
to the Global Finance Crisis (GFC) in 2009 and the Russian 
recession in 2013-2014, but though it seems that it will have a 
big negative effect, these events did not lead to sector reduc-
tion. The only contraction from 2004-2015 was due to a severe 
drought in 2010, which resulted in a sharp fall in real agricul-
ture GDP [1, p. 3].

As per R. Kloeppinger-Todd & M. Sharma, study made 
globally in many countries shows, that financial institutions 
have demonstrated low interest in rural area lending for differ-
ent reasons. Particularly, many rural households were located 
in farther parts of the regions and often so dispersed that lend-
ers need to make bigger efforts and costs to provide services to 
them. Another issue related to rural area financing is weather 
and climate risks, making it hard for MFIs and banks hedge the 
financial services or operate profitable insurance another issue 
is lower educational level among borrowers. Finally, financial 
institutions hardly calculate agricultural business risks within 
its specificities [21, p. 2]. 

The reasons why financial institutions consider agricultural 
financing to be unprofitable may be different. The main reason 
in Armenia, still, is the high risk correlated with weather and 
climate conditions, diseases. In many cases, managing these 
risks is unpredictable and hard. Currently, a pilot experiment 
is underway in Armenia to ensure crop insurance according to 
weather conditions, which can shorten risks and make agri-
cultural financing more profitable and efficient. Other reasons 
may be the high operating costs, since the average volume of 
agricultural loans is much lower than that of industrial or busi-
ness loans, which boost the operating costs, as well as their 
distribution in different rural communities. Moreover, loan 
debt collection and contract implementation procedures are 
particularly taking long time in rural districts of Armenia. The 
restrictions faced by the non-bank lending realm are mainly re-
lated to regulations. The lack of regulation for MFI lending in-
stitutions, combined with the official idea that only banks can 
take out deposits as their daily activities, makes this sector un-
derdeveloped and unable to serve this market segment. In case 
of leasing, the regulation of VAT leads to the fact that leasing 
is less attractive to customers than a regular bank loan. Lack of 
the adjustment or lack of appropriate adjustment leaves nega-
tive impact on VAT, but due to the nature of the agricultural 
sector it is even more noticeable. 

To conclude, several global reasons about lack of financial 
institutions to finance rural habitants can be taken out. First-
ly, very small amount of loans in different parts of the region 
brings to huge operational costs. Second is hardly managing 
risks which face farmers, mainly weather and climate risks, 
which insurance companies in emerging countries doesn’t 
cover or cover with non-affordable price. Another problem is 
low profitability of agricultural business, which doesn’t cover 
higher interest rates for micro and small loans provided for 
farmers or rural area living individuals. Lack of collateral has 
been considered to be an obstacle for rural habitants to be 
financed. And one of the biggest issues is low educational level 
of rural area habitants. Many MFIs though input technical as-
sistance with financing but this also not always works. 

In the situation of the development of the post-industrial 
economy, the way of the financing of reproduction of the mate-
rial and technical base of enterprises in the agrarian sector has 
experienced some considerable changes. One of the important 
issues of active technical upgrade of fixed assets in the agri-
cultural sector is a significant deficit of funds that could be 
dispense for ensuring this process. 

State support of farmers and food processing companies 
should be based on development of more effective method for 
allocating budgetary funds. Steps done for increase of leas-
ing instrument usage in agricultural sector should function 
based on the market competition and involving private leas-
ing companies as well as state leasing companies too. In order 
to strengthen cooperation with agrarian enterprises, the gov-
ernment should foster private leasing companies by partially 
compensating the leasing rate of interest at a level that is the 
size of the Central Bank's discount rate; by way of partially 
compensating the value of the leased asset after preliminary 
payment by the lessee at the rate that is reciprocal to the ad-
vance payment but not more than 30 % [22, p. 7].

An exogenous shock for Armenian agricultural sector is con-
sidered to be COVID-19 pandemic, which closes borders with ex-
ternal world and farmers could not plan export of their production. 

Respondents believe that the pandemic had a moderate neg-
ative impact on their activities. From the table above we see, 
that pandemic has some negative impact on 70 % of respond-
ers. Only some small farmers who sells its production in local 
markets haven’t been negatively impacted from the pandemic.

Armenian Government started to implement several pro-
grams to save the situation by subsidizing agricultural loans. 
Another program was co-financing the agricultural coopera-
tives. The experience of implementing the idea of cooperation 
shows that agricultural cooperatives can solve many signifi-
cant problems in the agricultural sector of Armenia, such as 
overcoming difficulties in selling agricultural products, using 
agricultural equipment, providing resources (fuel, seeds, fer-
tilizers, etc.). Thus, one of the main goals of the government 
in this sector should be to increase the participation of house-
holds in agricultural cooperatives [23, pp. 121–122]. 

Because of COVID-19 pandemic, Government of the Rus-
sian Federation approved a rule dated in 03.06.2020 No. 811 
“For the provision of subsidies from the federal budget for 
compensation of losses of Russian leasing organizations when 
providing the lessee with a discount on advance payment un-
der leasing contracts for specialized equipment”. The program 
provides lessee with a one-time discount on advance payment 
in the amount of 10–15 % of the price of different machinery 
and equipment, depending on the region of supply. The state, 
in turn, fully compensates leasing companies for losses due 
to the provision of a discount. For the implementation of this 
measure of state support in 2020, approximately 53 million 
USD were provided. The leasing subsidy will make it possible 
to supply 10.5 thousand units of machinery and equipment this 
year, of which 2.5 thousand units at the expense of additional 
financing. It's important also to note that starting from first 
January 2020, Russia plans to suspend integrated development 
of rural areas, the program for subsidizing agriculture equip-
ment manufacturers and introduce a system of preferential 
leasing with state support for Russian plants to sell agricultural 
machinery by leasing [24, p. 1].
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A similar project is implemented by the minister of the Kyr-
gyz Republic M. Abylgaziev called “Financing of agriculture” 
which aimed to improve the breeding cattle and elite seed pro-
duction. The total amount of the project in 2020 will exceed 
70 million USD. This will allow not only enlarging existing 
farms, but also increasing potential export and preserving food 
security. A part of the project will be done using leasing finan-
cial instrument. As for leasing financing, a study of the leas-
ing market showed that international organizations also have 
an interest in supporting leasing in Kyrgyzstan [25, p. 1]. For 
example, the Asian Development Bank is implementing a pro-
gram to support women's entrepreneurship, in which it pays at-
tention in raising the awareness of women entrepreneurs about 
leasing. In addition, the study showed that GIZ also provides 
“technical” support to facilitate the development of leasing in 
Kyrgyzstan [26, p. 43].

At the first steps of the development of market relations 
of Ukraine, the need to renew the equipment and organize 
the availability of progressive technologies and competitive 
production, especially in the leading sectors of the economy, 
depends on the frequent usage of leasing transactions. Consid-
ering that in the conditions of the economic crisis, the possi-
bility of access of local enterprises to classic lending products 
to fill in required financial resources becomes very difficult 
and in the unprofitable conditions, and it makes attention to a 
financial instrument such as leasing which can be very neces-
sary. The development of the leasing market in Ukraine re-
quires a transparent, consistent legislation. Unfortunately, the 
legal regulation of leasing activity in Ukraine is far from being 
perfect. Norms of legal acts are not effective and sometimes 
rejects each other [27, p. 25]. Actual situation of the develop-
ment of leasing requires difficult combination of legal, organi-
zational and economic basis for the provision of state support 

for leasing activities at the legislative level. When developing 
tools and implementing state regulation tools and supporting 
leasing activities, it is essential to measure not only the size, 
but also the direction of use of these tools. International expe-
rience and tools for regulating leasing activities should also be 
beneficial. A similar to Russian and Kyrgyzstan countries’ ex-
periment is used in Armenia. Starting from 2017, Government 
of Armenia started to partially subsidize percentage rates of 
agricultural loans and leasing in Armenia. Government wanted 
to ensure a very low percentage on leasing so that the villagers, 
as well as agricultural companies, cooperatives, communities, 
can take advantage of the program. 

From the discussion we see, that most of the countries run 
governmental support programs for agricultural growth ex-
pansion, and some of them use leasing as a financial instru-
ment for implementing support programs. The reasons can 
be different. Banks find uninteresting to finance agriculture, 
which becomes one of the main factors for governments to in-
tervene. The study showed also that the pandemic had a nega-
tive impact on rural residents and farmers, which means that 
taking into consideration the food security issue, strategic im-
portance of agriculture, and the financial vulnerability of the 
rural population, there is a need to develop effective financial 
and non-financial tools to alleviate the situation.

Below, leasing specificities and possible government sup-
port programs in Armenia were discussed. When planning the 
purchase of new fixed assets, the question undoubtedly arises 
as to what financial means can be used to accomplish the idea. 
Today, the two simplest options for this issue are credit lending 
and financial leasing. In many cases it is easier to get financed 
through leasing rather than through credit. This is because 
leasing makes it possible to obtain equipment or technology 
with little initial capital (1/3 or less) or change the type of 

Table 1
COVID-19 pandemic impact on rural habitants

Frequency Percent Valid Percent Cumulative Percent

Valid

No 15 30.0 30.0 30.0
Yes, has left a significant negative impact 24 48.0 48.0 78.0

Yes, had a negative effect on the average size 7 14.0 14.0 92.0
Yes, left little impact 4 8.0 8.0 100.0

Total 50 100.0 100.0

Table 2
Differences between financial leasing and commercial loan

Leasing Credit
1.	 As a rule, financial leasing does not presuppose the 
existence of collateral, as collateral is the subject of the lease, 
which belongs to the lessor during the entire period of the 
contract

1.	 From the moment of receiving the loan until its repayment 
deadline, the borrower demands a corresponding collateral 
which can be sold in case of non-fulfillment or improper 
fulfillment of obligations by the borrower

2.	 Leasing rent schedule can be based on a mutually agreed 
schedule

2.	 The terms and conditions of the loan repayment are not 
aimed at the borrower's interests but at ensuring the bank's 
liquidity ratio

3.	 Preferential period, is before receiving the subject of 
leasing does not make payments to the leasing company

3.	 In general, there is no grace period for a loan with 
seasonal payments

4.	 Simplicity and speed of registration up to one day 4.	 A larger package of documents is required when 
submitting for a loan

5.	 Leasing can be provided for both short-term, medium-
term and long-term 5.	 Commercial loans are provided for up to 5 years
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product that is not in demand returning the equipment to the 
leaseholder, in case of the classic leasing agreement. This is 
the main attraction of leasing, which is a substantial feature 
compared to the other types of lending. 

From table 2 several advantages of leasing transactions 
were shown. In some countries, leasing organizations also 
provide tax benefits for the lessee [28, p. 23]. Without making 
large initial investments, the leaseholder gets the opportunity 
to replace old equipment with new ones and produce competi-
tive production. As for government many countries have ad-
opted a leasing development policy because they see it as a 
modern way to boost investment activity. Leasing contributes 
to the collection of funds for investment activities through its 
mechanism ensures the insured use of investment resources to 
upgrade production. For suppliers, leasing is an opportunity 
to sell the product. They sign a partnership agreement with 
leasing organizations and provide discounts to ensure a stable 
sales mechanism for their products [29, p. 30]. These advan-
tages are only few of those, which can be used to develop 
competitive financial product. As we see, some countries use 
leasing advantages for supporting agricultural or overall eco-
nomic growth. Some countries, such as Ukraine, use limited 
opportunities of leasing for state support projects as at current 
stage there are legal and regulatory problems of using leasing 
in its full potential. In Armenia, the situation with leasing regu-
lation was also poor, but in latest years several big changes 
have been organized concerning leasing regulation which will 
help its future effective use.

In Armenia, from the first signs of the pandemic, when 
the government began to think about implementing economic 
support programs, leasing began to be considered as an effec-
tive financial tool for implementing support programs. It was 
proposed to finance complete projects through leasing, i.e. to 
consider the whole greenhouse as a subject of leasing, ie not 
the technological part of the greenhouse economy. The same 
thing started to apply to refrigeration farms, also to non-ag-
ricultural projects. The latter confirms the importance of the 
role of leasing, especially in financing rural communities. Ac-

cording to the official data of the Ministry of Economy, there 
is currently a state support program for leasing concerning the 
purchase of agro-food equipment in Armenia. During the six 
months of 2020, only 284 leasing transactions were carried 
out under state support programs, which is 20 % more than 
last year. 2019 As of the end of 2010, the loan portfolio in 
Armenia is about 8 milliards of USD, of which 600 million 
USD are property acquisition deals. But leasing transactions 
amount to 40–60 million USD. In fact, most of the equipment, 
production lines, and thickeners are financed through loans, 
not leasing. In fact, the demand for leasing may be 10 times 
higher than it is now. In March 2020, the program of lease 
and agricultural loan percentage rate subsidization is overwrit-
ten and the percentage rate started to be subsidized by 100 % 
till end of 2020, so farmers get 0 % interest rate financing. 
In 2017, in the case of leasing of agricultural equipment, the 
farmer (or enterprise) paid 2 % instead of 9 %, and in case 
of leasing for processing equipment (for example, pasteuriza-
tion machines for milk or for cooking eggplant) – 4 %. For 
loans, minimum interest rate was 5 %. Leasing has advantages 
in terms of interest rate as Government evaluates potential of 
leasing as an effective financial tool. Now these financing be-
comes completely interest-free for borrowers. In addition, all 
interest on micro agricultural loans up to 2 thousand dollars 
were also subsidized to farmers, in case banks and MFIs put an 
interest rate of maximum 13 % and a period of up to two years.  
New support measures are also provided for cooperative loans. 
The state provides 10 % co-financing to agricultural coopera-
tives, and 10 % co-financing to other economic entities, but 
not more than 20 000 USD. 

The quantitative analysis is made to evaluate benefits of 
leasing for government support of agriculture and advantages 
of lease financing for rural habitants. Survey consists of 25 
questions which discovers issues related to the identification 
of important elements of lending, as well as the applicability 
of leasing among farmers. It is made via private messaging to 
specific clientele among farmers and rural habitants of differ-
ent regions as well as via face to face visits to clients. Overall 

Table 3
Correlations between different measures of responders1

Age Agricultural 
employment

Financial 
service used Gov. Program Individual or 

cooperative

Age
Pearson Correlation 1 –.220 –.168 –.132 .097

Sig. (2-tailed) .125 .245 .360 .505
N 50 50 50 50 50

Agricultural 
employment

Pearson Correlation –.220 1 .028 .183 .169
Sig. (2-tailed) .125 .848 .203 .240

N 50 50 50 50 50

Financial service 
used

Pearson Correlation –.168 .028 1 .069 –.136
Sig. (2-tailed) .245 .848 .636 .347

N 50 50 50 50 50

Gov. Program
Pearson Correlation –.132 .183 .069 1 .000

Sig. (2-tailed) .360 .203 .636 .997
N 50 50 50 50 50

Individual or 
cooperative

Pearson Correlation .097 .169 -.136 .000 1
Sig. (2-tailed) .505 .240 .347 .997

N 50 50 50 50 50
1 All respondents are small and medium farmers from different regions of Armenia
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50 farmers answered to the questions. Most of the responders 
were from 29-60 years old (66 %), 62 % were male and 38 % 
female. We have responders from all 10 regions of Armenia, 
mainly 32 % from Ararat region, 20 % from Shirak region, 
18 % from Armavir region and 30 % left from other regions. 
Occupation of the responders was split 50 % of responders 
were crop production, 32 % agricultural and food processing 
and 18 % livestock breeding.

The combination of the questions in the tables indicates that 
people in different age groups have a higher level of awareness 
than others; they tend to make a different choice than the cur-
rent active farmers. Pearson correlation shows, that older age 
group responders appreciate the cooperative idea, in contrast 
to young farmers who prefer individual agriculture. The high-
est correlation .169 is registered agricultural employment and 
choice between individual vs cooperative type of farming. Re-
search conducts that those, who own small plots of land or 
farms are also inclined to the idea of cooperatives. 

On table 4 we see comparison of age and government 
support program which is the most efficient as per respond-
ers. Data shows that most of the responders made importance 
on interest rate subsidy program. Only one responder answers 
leasing program as the most important state support program. 
Taking into consideration the data, by analyzing for which age 
group leasing is most desirable, it is possible to do the right 
marketing specifically for that target group. For example, if 
the state tends to support small farmers or senior age experi-
enced farmers, leasing can develop the idea of activating coop-
eratives (taking into consideration the data from table 3), thus 
solving two problems at once in terms of meeting the needs 
of specific customers, increasing the applicability of leasing.

Based on literature review and experience of the countries 
discussed in the article about leasing advantages and alterna-

tives to banking loans, an attempt was made to study the most 
important element of borrowing money for farmers. Half of 
the responders (50 %) answered low interest rate as the most 
important element in borrowing process. In contrast, absence 
of collateral was chosen by the least number of respondents. 
A number of researches shows absence of collateral as one of 
the hardest problems for farmers and rural area habitants for 
crediting, but we see, that this problem becomes less important 
for borrowers. This means absence of collateral cannot be cho-
sen as sole key advantage of leasing for its promotion, other 
advantages need to be specified too.

According to table 6 data, major part of responders an-
swered negatively for possible alternatives of crediting. It 
means, that there are not so many ways to get financial re-
sources for farmers and rural habitants from other sources be-
sides banking loans. Leasing can play a role of an alternative 
financial instrument for classic financing and help borrowers 
to diversify their choice.

From the table 7 & 8 we see, that the vast majority of re-
spondents did not use leasing. The further question strengthens 
our assertion that the respondents are not familiar with leasing 
as a financial product, especially its features. Most of them 
even didn’t hear about government support program through 
leasing even though government used different resources for 
its promotion. Only 10 % of the responders answered posi-
tively for using leasing and most of them seems to use leasing 
within governmental support instrument. Leasing companies 
and banks doesn’t provide any specific advantages to borrow-
ers for choosing leasing product such as special discounts or 
privileged warranty which are usually estimated from manu-
facturers to leasing providers, or tax/accounting benefits which 
are considered from specific products or types of clients.

Table 4
Cross tabulation of the age of responders and government support program importance

Possible Government Support Programs
TotalFree dose of fuel, 

elite seeds
Co-financing of smart cattle 

ranches, greenhouses and other 
programs

Interest rate 
subsidy

State support 
program through 

leasing

Age

18–28 1 1 7 1 10
29–40 0 6 10 0 16
41–60 2 4 11 0 17
61+ 7 0 0 0 7

Total 10 11 28 1 50

Table 5
Importance in loan provision procedure

Frequency Percent Valid Percent Cumulative Percent

Valid

Quickness 7 14.0 14.0 14.0
Low interest rate 25 50.0 50.0 64.0

Seasonal payments 8 16.0 16.0 80.0
Lack of collateral or profitable Loan / 

collateral ratio 5 10.0 10.0 90.0

Technical support 5 10.0 10.0 100.0
Total 50 100.0 100.0
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We see significant correlation .437 between those who an-
swered negatively whether they have applied for a leasing or 
not and to the question whether they are familiar to leasing 
specificities. Only 4 responders out of 50 answered positively 
to the both questions at the same time. It approves the theory, 
that borrowers don’t prefer leasing because of lack of informa-
tion about this product.

Summarizing the survey results, it is obvious, that the state 
leasing support program is quite effective as all of the respond-
ers who used leasing, at the same time, are beneficiaries of the 
state leasing program. At the same time analysis on different 
countries’ experience also supports this hypothesis. Howev-
er, standard state support programs can be upgraded, which 
will put a lighter financial burden on the state and become a 
competitive alternative to bank loans for a large number of 
customers. Educational level of rural habitants and inconve-
nience about financing alternatives has been proved as an ob-
stacle for much optimal financing of them. At the same time, 
mostly no alternatives were fixed for borrowers in the group.

Discussion and Conclusion
In almost every country in the world, governments support 

leasing as it is an effective tool for economic development. 
The development of leasing and its benefits for all parties of 

the contract can greatly affect the economy of Armenia & other 
developing countries, as, for example, in agriculture and other 
fields of the economy professional equipment and technolo-
gies are out of date and need to be upgraded. Such equipment 
is mostly used by small & medium-sized businesses & farms.

Despite the economic, social and political importance of 
the Armenian agricultural sector, its growth is still not suffi-
cient because of number of reasons, mainly lack of efficient fi-
nancing and technologies. The conclusions of this study show 
that agricultural finance is provided at a much lower level in 
Armenia than would be anticipated judging by the importance 
of this sector to the country’s economy and GDP. 

A hypothesis of leasing as an effective tool for rural area 
development has been proven. Several obstacles of leasing 
development have been taken out as insufficient information 
about leasing advantages, legal and regulatory gaps, weak 
government support etc. 

Taking into consideration analysis of survey results, we 
see, that the public awareness about leasing, presentation of 
leasing benefits will make its use more accessible to customers 
as an alternative to bank loans. The applicability of leasing in 
Armenia is lacking and has great potential for development, 
but the answers to some questions suggest that the potential of 

Table 6
Alternatives to bank loans

Frequency Percent Valid Percent Cumulative Percent

Valid

Friend, acquaintance, 
debt from a friend 7 14.0 14.0 14.0

Grant programs 7 14.0 14.0 28.0
Involvement of partners 8 16.0 16.0 44.0

No alternative 28 56.0 56.0 100.0
Total 50 100.0 100.0

Table 7
Awareness of leasing features 

Frequency Percent Valid Percent Cumulative Percent

Valid
Yes 12 24.0 24.0 24.0
No 38 76.0 76.0 100.0

Total 50 100.0 100.0

Table 8
Usage of leasing

Frequency Percent Valid Percent Cumulative Percent

Valid
Yes 5 10.0 10.0 10.0
No 45 90.0 90.0 100.0

Total 50 100.0 100.0

Table 9
Correlations between usage of leasing among responders and information about leasing features

Usage of leasing or not Info about features of leasing

Usage of leasing or not
Pearson Correlation 1 .437**

Sig. (2-tailed) .002
N 50 50

Info about features of leasing
Pearson Correlation .437** 1
Sig. (2-tailed) .002
N 50 50

Note. ** correlation is significant at the 0.01 level (2-tailed). 
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leasing may be overestimated, such as the lack of collateral as a 
major lending problem for rural customers. Survey results also 
shows, that solving sole collateral issue cannot be satisfying 
condition for leasing development and awareness element and 
there can be beneficial synergies for government to implement 
specific development strategies through leasing (example of 
cooperatives). As a recommendation, specific leasing product 
can be designed by governments or private leasing companies 
with a specific list of manufacturers with their full contacts and 

specialization for rural habitants who want to buy equipment 
and provide exclusive service and price in case of buying leas-
ing object from these manufacturers.
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